
                                                                                                  
 

 
 
 
                                      
 
 
 

November 9th, 2011 
 
To Whom It May Concern:  
 
The City Council approved the following for Medical/Dental/Life on November 8th, 2011:  
 
2011 Medical/Dental/ Life Bids 
 

• Health Advantage High and Low Option medical plans 
• Blue Cross/Blue Shield High and Low Option dental plans 
• USAble Life Insurance   

 
For additional information please contact Lisa Mabry Williams, Human Resource Director at 
lisa.williams@cityofconway.org or 501.450.7087.  
 
 
Thank you,  
 

YxÄ|v|t eÉzxÜá  
 
Felicia T. Rogers 
Executive Assistant to the Mayor 
 
 
 
 

11/9/2011 

City of Conway  
Mayor’s Office 
1201 Oak Street 

Conway, AR 72032 
www.cityofconway.org  

 

mailto:lisa.williams@cityofconway.org
http://www.cityofconway.org/
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CITY OF CONWAY 
1201 Oak Street 

Conway, Arkansas 72032 
 

Invitation and Bid 2011 - 32   
 

2012 MEDICAL INSURANCE 
 
             
 
FIRM NAME:  Health Advantage/Blue Cross & Blue Shield BY:  Bentley Pew 
 
 
TTL Monthly Premium Cost  Health Option #1A  Health Option #1B  (dual option plan)  
 
Employee Only   $  294.30   $  271.50   
 
Employee + Spouse  $  561.30   $  517.60 
 
Employee + Children  $  494.80   $  455.80  
 
Employee + Family   $  774.30   $  713.90   
 
 
TTL Monthly Premium Cost  Health Option #2  
 
Employee Only   $  273.40    
 
Employee + Spouse  $  519.50   
 
Employee + Children  $  459.40    
 
Employee + Family   $  719.10   
 
 
TTL Monthly Premium Cost  Health Option #3 
 
   
Employee Only   $  289.10   
  
Employee + Spouse  $  549.30     
 
Employee + Children  $  485.70 
  
Employee + Family   $  760.30    
 
 
TTL Monthly Premium Cost  Health Option #4 
   
Employee Only   $  291.90   
  
Employee + Spouse  $  554.70     
 
Employee + Children  $  490.50 
  
Employee + Family   $  767.80 
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CITY OF CONWAY 
1201 Oak Street 

Conway, Arkansas 72032 
 

Invitation and Bid 2011 - 32   
 

2012 MEDICAL INSURANCE 
 
             
 
FIRM NAME:  United Health Care of the River Valley    BY:  Mike Styduhar 
 
 
 
TTL Monthly Premium Cost  Health Option #1A  Health Option #1B  (dual option plan)  
 
Employee Only   $  290.03   $  267.56    
 
Employee + Spouse  $  552.92   $  510.10   
 
Employee + Children  $  486.90   $  449.19 
 
Employee + Family   $  762.61   $  703.55    
 
 
TTL Monthly Premium Cost  Health Option #2 - no bid submitted for Option #2 
 
 
Employee Only   $     
 
Employee + Spouse  $     
 
Employee + Children  $      
 
Employee + Family   $      
 
 
TTL Monthly Premium Cost  Health Option #3 - no bid submitted for Option #3 
 
 
   
Employee Only   $    
  
Employee + Spouse  $       
 
Employee + Children  $   
  
Employee + Family   $     
 
 
TTL Monthly Premium Cost  Health Option #4 – no bid submitted for Option #4 
   
Employee Only   $  
  
Employee + Spouse  $      
 
Employee + Children  $   
  
Employee + Family   $ 
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CITY OF CONWAY 

1201 Oak Street 
Conway, Arkansas 72032 

 
Invitation and Bid 2011 - 32   

 
2012 MEDICAL INSURANCE 

             
 
 
FIRM NAME:  Arkansas Municipal League Health Benefit Fund BY:  AML 
 
 
No bid submitted for Option #1A and #1B 
TTL Monthly Premium Cost  Health Option #1A  Health Option #1B  (dual option plan)  
 
Employee Only   ______________  ______________   
 
Employee + Spouse  ______________  ______________   
 
Employee + Children  ______________  ______________   
 
Employee + Family   ______________  ______________   
 
 
TTL Monthly Premium Cost  Health Option #2- no bid submitted for Option #2 
 
Employee Only   ______________    
 
Employee + Spouse  ______________    
 
Employee + Children  ______________    
 
Employee + Family   ______________    
 
 
TTL Monthly Premium Cost  Health Option #3 - no bid submitted for Option #3 
 
   
Employee Only   ______________   
  
Employee + Spouse  ______________     
 
Employee + Children  ______________ 
  
Employee + Family   ______________    
 
 
TTL Monthly Premium Cost  Health Option #4     (also includes life, dental, visIon) 
   
Employee Only   $  305.00   
  
Employee + Spouse  $  375.00 (dependent) 
 
Employee + Children   
  
Employee + Family   $  680.00 
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CITY OF CONWAY 
1201 Oak Street 

Conway, Arkansas 72032 
 

Invitation and Bid 2011 - 32   
 

2012 DENTAL IINSURANCE 
 
             
 
FIRM NAME:  Delta Blue Ark Blue Cross & Blue Shield BY:  Bentley Pew 
 
TTL Monthly Premium Cost  Dental Option #1A  Dental Option #1B  (dual option plan)  
 
Employee Only   $  22.70   $  24.90   
 
Employee + Spouse  $  46.30   $  51.30   
 
Employee + Children  $  54.70   $  60.90   
 
Employee + Family   $  66.90   $  74.40   
 
 
 
 
 
FIRM NAME:  United Health Care Dental   BY:  Mike Styduhar  
 
TTL Monthly Premium Cost  Dental Option #1A  Dental Option #1B  (dual option plan)  
 
Employee Only   $  22.04   $  24.50  
 
Employee + Spouse  $  45.56   $  50.48    
 
Employee + Children  $  53.82   $  59.93   
 
Employee + Family   $  65.83   $  73.21 
 
 
 
 
 
FIRM NAME:  Humana Specialty Benefits   BY:  Brad Morrison 
 
TTL Monthly Premium Cost  Dental Option #1A  Dental Option #1B  (dual option plan)  
 
Employee Only   $  20.94   $  23.27   
 
Employee + Spouse  $  43.27   $  47.95   
 
Employee + Children  $  51.13   $  56.92   
 
Employee + Family   $  62.53   $  69.54   
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CITY OF CONWAY 
1201 Oak Street 

Conway, Arkansas 72032 
 

Invitation and Bid 2011 - 32   
 

2012 DENTAL IINSURANCE 
 
             
 
FIRM NAME:  Liberty Dental Plan    BY:  John Carvelli 
 
TTL Monthly Premium Cost  Dental Option #1A  Dental Option #1B  (dual option plan)  
 
Employee Only   $  22.40   $  24.89   
 
Employee + Spouse  $  46.30   $  51.29   
 
Employee + Children  $  54.70   $  60.88   
 
Employee + Family   $  66.90   $  74.38   
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CITY OF CONWAY 
1201 Oak Street 

Conway, Arkansas 72032 
 

Invitation and Bid 2011 - 32   
 

2012 LIFE INSURANCE 
 
             
 
FIRM NAME:  Health Advantage/USAble Life   BY:  Bentley Pew 
 
TTL Monthly Premium Cost  Life Option #1    
 
Employee Only   $  .16 per 1,000  
  
 
 
 
 
FIRM NAME:  United Health Care    BY:  Mike Styduhar 
 
TTL Monthly Premium Cost  Life Option #1    
 
Employee Only   $   .22 per 1.000   
  
 
 
 
 
FIRM NAME:  Minnesota Life     BY:  Bill Ochs 
 
TTL Monthly Premium Cost  Life Option #1    
 
Employee Only   $   .15 per 1,000   
  
 
 


